

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310019635 Solicitation # 1310004290 Closing Date 10/25/2018 Buyer Clifton Wallace CPO				Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address	
				BSA Intercontinental 36 Nighthawk, Irvine CA. 92604		Paramount Enterprise Corp., 8020 N. Classen Blvd, OKC, OK 73114		MacDonald & Owen, 1900 Riley Road, Sporta, WI 54656	
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension
1	5/4 STRAIGHT LINE RIP-ONE EDGE	10,000	BFT	\$ 1.95	\$ 19,500.00	\$ 2.06	\$ 20,600.00	\$ 2.19	\$ 21,900.00
2	6/4 STRAIGHT LINE RIP-ONE EDGE POPLAR WOOD, FAS ONE FACE, HIT OR MISS (1-7/16)	8,000	BFT	\$ 1.96	\$ 15,680.00	\$ 2.13	\$ 17,040.00	\$ 2.26	\$ 18,080.00
3	8/4 STRAIGHT LINE RIP-ONE EDGE	4,000	BFT	\$ 1.96	\$ 7,840.00	\$ 2.13	\$ 8,520.00	\$ 2.34	\$ 9,360.00
4	LUMBER:4/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	5,000	BF	\$ 2.05	\$ 10,250.00	\$ 2.56	\$ 12,800.00	\$ 2.15	\$ 10,750.00
5	LUMBER:5/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	7,000	BF	\$ 2.35	\$ 16,450.00	\$ 3.13	\$ 21,910.00	\$ 2.50	\$ 17,500.00
6	LUMBER:6/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	18,000	BF	\$ 2.60	\$ 46,800.00	\$ 3.13	\$ 56,340.00	\$ 2.75	\$ 49,500.00
7	LUMBER:8/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	6,000	BF	\$ 3.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 3.33	\$ 19,980.00	\$ 2.95	\$ 17,700.00
8	PLYWOOD: 5/8in x 4ft x 8ft	200	EA	\$ 41.10	\$ 8,220.00	\$ 45.45	\$ 9,090.00		NO BID
9	PLYWOOD: 3/4in x 4ft x 8ft	200	EA	\$ 49.46	\$ 9,892.00	\$ 52.99	\$ 10,598.00		NO BID
10	PLYWOOD: 3/4in x 4ft x 8ft	200	EA	\$ 31.10	\$ 6,220.00	\$ 41.92	\$ 8,384.00		NO BID
11	PLYWOOD: 1/2in x 4ft x 8 ft	200	EA	\$ 21.64	\$ 4,328.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 5,600.00		NO BID
12	3/4" RED OAK VENEER, A-1, R/C OR P/S, CLEAR 2-SIDES 4'X8' SHEETS	200	SH	\$ 82.20	\$ 16,440.00	\$ 70.75	\$ 14,150.00		NO BID
13	1/2" RED OAK VENEER, A-1, R/C OR P/S, CLEAR 2-SIDES 4' X 8' SHEETS	200	SH	\$ 64.00	\$ 12,800.00	\$ 88.50	\$ 17,700.00		NO BID
14	1/4" RED OAK VENEER, A-1, R/C OR P/S, CLEAR 2-SIDES 4'X8' SHEETS	200	SH	\$ 45.10	\$ 9,020.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 9,200.00		NO BID
15	3/4" IMPORTED PINE PLYWOOD, B-C, CABINET GRADE, SANDED 4'X8' SHEETS	200	SH		NO BID	\$ 46.50	\$ 9,300.00		NO BID
16	3/8" BALTIC BIRCH PLYWOOD, BB/BB, CABINET GRADE, SANDED 5'X5' SHEETS	200	SH	\$ 22.11	\$ 4,422.00	\$ 28.50	\$ 5,700.00		NO BID
17	1/4" BALTIC BIRCH PLYWOOD, BB/BB, CABINET GRADE, SANDED 5'X5' SHEETS	200	SH	\$ 16.50	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 4,000.00		NO BID
18	3/4" IMPORTED PINE PLYWOOD, VENEER CORE, B-C 4'X8' SHEETS	200	SH		NO BID	\$ 46.50	\$ 9,300.00		NO BID
Subtotal							\$ 260,212.00		
Discount				-0.5%	\$ -	-1.0%	\$ (2,602.12)	-1.0%	\$ -
Total Page					\$ -		\$ 257,609.88		\$ -
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)				TX / TIE BID		OK / NA		WI / NA	
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)									
Overall Low Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:	
				Lead Time: 14-21 days (Line 1-7). Lead Time: 10-14 days (Line 8-14)		Lead Time: 2 weeks (lines 1-3) Lead Time: Prompt (line 4), 2 Weeks (line 5), 2-4 weeks (line 6), 2 Weeks (lines 7-11), 2-4 Weeks (line 12), 4-6 Weeks (line 13), 2 Weeks (line 14), PROMPT (line 15), 2 Weeks (line 16-18).		Lead Time: 3 weeks or sooner.	
Paramount Enterprise Corp., 8020 N. Classen Blvd, OKC, OK 73114				Buyer Tab Notes:		Buyer Tab Notes:		Buyer Tab Notes:	
				Response Incomplete				Response Incomplete	