Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310019550 Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address
Solicitation # 1310004267 Wheeler Metals 3100 W. 40th St. N.,| Industrial Welding & Tool Supply Ltd
R eeler Metals . . N.,| Industrial Welding & Tool Supply Ltd. .
Closing Date 8/1/2018 Muskogee OK 74401 5413 W. Reno Ave. OKC, OK 73127 No Bid
Buyer Clifton Wallace CPO
Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Extension Unit Cost Extension Unit Cost Extension

Self Shielded Flux Core
Carbon Steel Welding Wire:

1 AFM71T1045X33 $ - $ -
1st Year Pricing 19,800|LB $ 1401 $ 27,720.00 | $ 1.650 | $ 32,670.00 $ -
2nd Year Pricing 19,800|LB $ 1401 % 27,720.00 | $ 1750 | $ 34,650.00 $ -
3rd Year Pricing 19,800|LB $ 1401 $ 27,720.00 | $ 1.850 | $ 36,630.00 $ -
0.045” Hard Wire MIG

2 Welding Wire $ -
1st Year Pricing 19,800 $ 1.10|$  21,780.00 | No Bid $ -
2nd Year Pricing 19,800 $ 1.10]$ 21,780.00 | No Bid $ -
3rd Year Pricing 19,800 $ 1.10]$  21,780.00 | No Bid $ -
0.035™ Carbon Steel MIG

3 Welding Wire $ -
1st Year Pricing 28,512|LB $ 1101 $ 31,363.20 | $ 1.150 | $ 32,788.80 $ -
2nd Year Pricing 28,512|LB $ 1101 $ 31,363.20 | $ 1.200 | $ 34,214.40 $ -
3rd Year Pricing 28,512|LB $ 1101 $ 31,363.20 | $ 1.250 | $ 35,640.00 $ -

Subtotal $ 242,589.60 $ -
Discount 0.00%] $ - -1.00% 0.00%]| $ -
Total Page $ 242,589.60 $ -
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) OK N/A OK N/A
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)
Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks:
Overall Bid Awarded to
If Tariffs are imposed, IWTS will have
Lead Time: 3-4 days to pass onto customer. Lead Time 3-5
Business Days.
Buyer Tab Notes: Buyer Tab Notes: Buyer Tab Notes:

Wheeler Metals 3100 W. 40th St. N., Muskogee OK 74401

1% Discount @ Net 10




