

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #	1310019347			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
Solicitation #	1310004222			Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc., McKinney, TX								
Closing Date	3/14/2018											
Buyer	Akeya Goosby, CPO											
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
1	Bread											\$ -
	1st year pricing	7280	PK		1.20	\$ 8,736.00			\$ -			\$ -
	2nd year pricing	7280	PK		1.24	\$ 9,027.20			\$ -			\$ -
	3rd year pricing	7280	PK		1.28	\$ 9,318.40			\$ -			\$ -
	4th year pricing	7280	PK		1.32	\$ 9,609.60			\$ -			\$ -
	5th year pricing	7280	PK		1.36	\$ 9,900.80			\$ -			\$ -
2	Bread											\$ -
	1st year pricing	14	PK		No bid				\$ -			\$ -
	2nd year pricing	14	PK		No Bid				\$ -			\$ -
	3rd year pricing	14	PK		No bid				\$ -			\$ -
	4th year pricing	14	PK		No bid				\$ -			\$ -
	5th year pricing	14	PK		No bid				\$ -			\$ -
3	Buns											\$ -
	1st year pricing	14	PK		1.26	\$ 17.64			\$ -			\$ -
	2nd year pricing	14	PK		1.30	\$ 18.20			\$ -			\$ -
	3rd year pricing	14	PK		1.34	\$ 18.76			\$ -			\$ -
	4th year pricing	14	PK		1.38	\$ 19.32			\$ -			\$ -
	5th year pricing	14	PK		1.42	\$ 19.88			\$ -			\$ -
4	Buns											\$ -
	1st year pricing	20	PK		1.26	\$ 25.20			\$ -			\$ -
	3rd year pricing	20	PK		1.30	\$ 26.00			\$ -			\$ -
	2nd year pricing	20	PK		1.34	\$ 26.80			\$ -			\$ -
	3rd year pricing	20	PK		1.38	\$ 27.60			\$ -			\$ -
	5th year pricing	20	PK		1.42	\$ 28.40			\$ -			\$ -
Total Page						\$ 46,627.84			\$ -			\$ -
Discounts - Net 10						\$ -						
Grand Total						\$ 46,627.84						
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)				TX/N/A								
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)												
Bid Awarded to Overall low bid awarded to Bimbo Bakeries USA., Inc. of McKinney, TX.				Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:		
				Lead Time: 7 Days								
				Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes		
				Vendor does not supply Kosher bagels								