

Oklahoma Department of Corrections															
Contracts & Acquisitions Unit															
Bid Tabulation Sheet															
Requisition #	1310019222			Vendor Name and Address				Vendor Name and Address				Vendor Name and Address			
Solicitation #	1310004183			Priefert Manufacturing, Mt. Pleasant, TX				Wheeler Metals Inc., Muskogee, OK				Quikservice Steel Co, Tulsa, OK			
Closing Date	10/5/2017											Albright Steel & Wire, OKC, OK			
Buyer	Randy Pogue, CPO														
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
Steel Tubing															
1	3/4 x .065" x 20' Square Hot Rolled	100	EA		\$ 5.96	\$ 596.00		\$ 5.68	\$ 568.00		\$ 7.56	\$ 756.00		\$ 6.14	\$ 614.00
2	1" x .065" x 20' Square Hot Rolled	3100	EA		\$ 7.59	\$ 23,529.00		\$ 7.68	\$ 23,808.00		\$ 9.84	\$ 30,504.00		\$ 8.32	\$ 25,792.00
3	1" x .120" x 20 Square Hot Rolled	2000	EA		\$ 13.73	\$ 27,460.00		\$ 12.87	\$ 25,740.00		\$ 16.68	\$ 33,360.00		\$ 12.80	\$ 25,600.00
4	1-1/2" x .065" x 20" Square Hot Rolled	100	EA		\$ 12.13	\$ 1,213.00		\$ 11.72	\$ 1,172.00		\$ 15.13	\$ 1,513.00		\$ 12.75	\$ 1,275.00
5	1 1/2" x .083" x 20' Square Hot Rolled	1800	EA		\$ 15.29	\$ 27,522.00		\$ 13.09	\$ 23,562.00		\$ 18.76	\$ 33,768.00		\$ 14.67	\$ 26,406.00
6	2" x .120" x 20' Square Hot Rolled	100	EA		\$ 29.80	\$ 2,980.00		\$ 27.44	\$ 2,744.00		\$ 34.20	\$ 3,420.00		\$ 29.14	\$ 2,914.00
7	1" x .049" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	6100	EA		\$ 4.89	\$ 29,829.00		\$ 5.18	\$ 31,598.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 9.43	\$ 57,523.00
8	1" x .083" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	1800	EA		\$ 7.66	\$ 13,788.00		\$ 7.16	\$ 12,888.00		\$ 10.57	\$ 19,026.00		\$ 10.36	\$ 18,648.00
9	1" x .120" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	260	EA		\$ 10.94	\$ 2,844.40		\$ 13.46	\$ 3,499.60		\$ 14.51	\$ 3,772.60		\$ 14.29	\$ 3,715.40
10	1 1/4" x .083" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	100	EA		\$ 10.03	\$ 1,003.00		\$ 8.44	\$ 844.00		\$ 13.16	\$ 1,316.00		\$ 14.21	\$ 1,421.00
11	1 1/2" x .065" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	3400	EA		\$ 9.76	\$ 33,184.00		\$ 9.98	\$ 33,932.00		\$ 12.95	\$ 44,030.00		\$ 12.51	\$ 42,534.00
12	1 1/2" x .083" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	300	EA		\$ 12.31	\$ 3,693.00		\$ 10.89	\$ 3,267.00		\$ 16.06	\$ 4,818.00		\$ 16.18	\$ 4,854.00
13	1 1/2" x .120" x A513 Round Hot Rolled	100	EA		\$ 17.34	\$ 1,734.00		\$ 24.64	\$ 2,464.00		\$ 21.97	\$ 2,197.00		\$ 23.38	\$ 2,338.00
14	1 5/8 (1.66)" x .049" x 20' Round Hot Rolled	400	EA		\$ 8.45	\$ 3,380.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 10.14	\$ 4,056.00
15	1 1/2" x 3/4" x .083" x 20' Rect. Hot Rolled	100	EA		\$ 16.46	\$ 1,646.00		\$ 15.68	\$ 1,568.00		\$ 16.06	\$ 1,606.00		\$ 15.64	\$ 1,564.00
16	1 1/2" x 1" x .083" x 20' Rect. Hot Rolled	200	EA		\$ 16.00	\$ 3,200.00		\$ 14.50	\$ 2,900.00		\$ 16.68	\$ 3,336.00		\$ 19.42	\$ 3,884.00
17	2" x 1" x .083" x 20' Rect. Hot Rolled	1200	EA		\$ 15.50	\$ 18,600.00		\$ 13.09	\$ 15,708.00		\$ 20.00	24000		\$ 16.21	\$ 19,452.00
18	3" x 1" x .120" x 20' Rect Hot Rolled	600	EA		\$ 29.73	\$ 17,838.00		\$ 30.96	\$ 18,576.00		\$ 37.51	\$ 22,506.00		\$ 43.95	\$ 26,370.00
Total Page						\$ 214,039.40			\$ 204,838.60			\$ 229,928.60			\$ 268,960.40
RECIPROCIITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A	(State / Preference)					TX / Tied Bids			OK / N/A			OK / N/A			OK / N/A
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)															
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:				Supplier Remarks:				Supplier Remarks:			
Overall low bid awarded to Priefert Manufacturing of Mt. Pleasant, Texas. As this solicitation is for an indefinite quantity contract and no quantities for any lines are guaranteed, factory chose to award to lowest supplier that responded to all items.				Lead Time: 4 Weeks				Lead Time: Lines 1-6, 8, 10, 12, 16-18 3-4 Days Lines 7 1-2 Weeks, Line 9 2-3 weeks, Line 11 3-4 weeks, Line 13 & 15 1 week				Lead Time: 1 Week			
				Buyer Tab Notes				Buyer Tab Notes				Buyer Tab Notes			
				Did not bid on line 14.											