

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # Solicitation # Closing Date Buyer				1310018928 1310004111 3/21/2017 Randy Pogue, CPO		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address	
				Wheeler Metals, Muskogee, OK		Albright Steel and Wire Co, Oklahoma City, OK		Priefert Steel, Mount Pleasant, TX			
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension
1	3/4" x 20' C1018 Solid Round	100	ea	\$ 11.17	\$ 1,117.00	\$ 20.85	\$ 2,085.00	\$ 12.38	\$ 1,238.00		
2	1" x 20' CR C1018 Solid Round	100	ea	\$ 19.86	\$ 1,986.00	\$ 38.15	\$ 3,815.00	\$ 21.99	\$ 2,199.00		
3	1" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea	\$ 6.08	\$ 608.00	\$ 7.16	\$ 716.00	\$ 6.39	\$ 639.00		
4	1-1/2" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea	\$ 9.40	\$ 940.00	\$ 11.15	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 10.19	\$ 1,019.00		
5	2" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea	\$ 12.36	\$ 1,236.00	\$ 14.52	\$ 1,452.00	\$ 13.70	\$ 1,370.00		
6	2-1/2" x 1/4" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea	\$ 29.93	\$ 2,993.00	\$ 34.33	\$ 3,433.00	\$ 33.14	\$ 3,314.00		
7	3/4" x .065" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea	\$ 5.53	\$ 553.00	\$ 6.49	\$ 649.00	\$ 6.96	\$ 696.00		
8	1" x .065" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea	\$ 7.49	\$ 749.00	\$ 8.85	\$ 885.00	\$ 8.55	\$ 855.00		
9	1" x .120" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea	\$ 12.53	\$ 1,253.00	\$ 14.22	\$ 1,422.00	\$ 13.45	\$ 1,345.00		
10	1-1/2" x .065" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea	\$ 11.42	\$ 1,142.00	\$ 11.89	\$ 1,189.00	\$ 13.13	\$ 1,313.00		
11	1-1/2" x .083" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea	\$ 12.95	\$ 1,295.00	\$ 16.60	\$ 1,660.00	\$ 14.98	\$ 1,498.00		
12	2" x .120" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea	\$ 26.72	\$ 2,672.00	\$ 34.38	\$ 3,438.00	\$ 28.73	\$ 2,873.00		
13	48" x 72" x 3/16" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 84.29	\$ 8,429.00	\$ 88.95	\$ 8,895.00	\$ 68.79	\$ 6,879.00		
14	60" x 67" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 112.39	\$ 11,239.00	\$ 118.59	\$ 11,859.00	\$ 91.72	\$ 9,172.00		
15	60" x 84" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 121.75	\$ 12,175.00	\$ 128.43	\$ 12,843.00	\$ 99.36	\$ 9,936.00		
16	60" x 96" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 135.80	\$ 13,580.00	\$ 143.25	\$ 14,325.00	\$ 110.83	\$ 11,083.00		
17	72" x 84" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 132.35	\$ 13,235.00	\$ 158.07	\$ 15,807.00	\$ 122.29	\$ 12,229.00		
18	72" x 96" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 152.18	\$ 15,218.00	\$ 160.54	\$ 16,054.00	\$ 129.08	\$ 12,908.00		
19	48" x 96" x 3/16" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 163.90	\$ 16,390.00	\$ 172.89	\$ 17,289.00	\$ 133.63	\$ 13,363.00		
20	48" x 78" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 187.31	\$ 18,731.00	\$ 197.58	\$ 19,758.00	\$ 152.86	\$ 15,286.00		
21	48" x 87" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 32.30	\$ 3,230.00	\$ 27.78	\$ 2,778.00	No Bid	No Bid		
22	48" x 96" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 38.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$ 33.98	\$ 3,398.00	No Bid	No Bid		
23	60" x 78" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 30.40	\$ 3,040.00	\$ 27.18	\$ 2,718.00	No Bid	No Bid		
24	60" x 84" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.25	\$ 4,525.00	No Bid	No Bid		
25	60" x 96" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.19	\$ 3,619.00	No Bid	No Bid		
26	48" x 96" x 3/4" x #9 Expanded Metal-Flat	100	sh	\$ 46.20	\$ 4,620.00	\$ 56.60	\$ 5,660.00	No Bid	No Bid		
27	1" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea	\$ 36.96	\$ 3,696.00	\$ 45.28	\$ 4,528.00	No Bid	No Bid		
28	1" x 1/4" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea	\$ 55.69	\$ 5,569.00	\$ 65.14	\$ 6,514.00	\$ 52.19	\$ 5,219.00		
29	1-1/4" x 3/8" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea	\$ 44.55	\$ 4,455.00	\$ 41.69	\$ 4,169.00	\$ 41.75	\$ 4,175.00		
30	2" x 1" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea	\$ 83.60	\$ 8,360.00	\$ 96.76	\$ 9,676.00	\$ 83.50	\$ 8,350.00		
31	2" x 21' Sch40 Black Pipe, Plain End	100	ea	\$ 66.88	\$ 6,688.00	\$ 77.40	\$ 7,740.00	\$ 66.80	\$ 6,680.00		
32	1" x .049" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 63.73	\$ 6,373.00	\$ 75.95	\$ 7,595.00	\$ 61.87	\$ 6,187.00		
33	1" x .083" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 79.90	\$ 7,990.00	\$ 95.25	\$ 9,525.00	\$ 77.57	\$ 7,757.00		
34	1" x .120" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 91.32	\$ 9,132.00	\$ 108.85	\$ 10,885.00	\$ 88.65	\$ 8,865.00		
35	1-1/4" x .083" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 95.88	\$ 9,588.00	\$ 114.30	\$ 11,430.00	No Bid	No Bid		
36	1-1/2" x .065" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 109.58	\$ 10,958.00	\$ 130.63	\$ 13,063.00	No Bid	No Bid		
37	1-1/2" x .083" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 9.91	\$ 991.00	\$ 11.72	\$ 1,172.00	\$ 5.31	\$ 531.00		
38	1-1/2" x .120" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea	\$ 7.01	\$ 701.00	\$ 13.42	\$ 1,342.00	\$ 7.85	\$ 785.00		
39	1-1/2" x 3/4" x .083" x 20' A513 Rectangular Tubing	100	ea	\$ 15.80	\$ 1,580.00	\$ 18.88	\$ 1,888.00	\$ 10.89	\$ 1,089.00		
40	1-1/2" x 1" x .083" x 20' A513 Rectangular Tubing	100	ea	\$ 8.15	\$ 815.00	\$ 16.65	\$ 1,665.00	\$ 9.99	\$ 999.00		
41	2" x 1" x .083" x 20' A513 Rectangular Tubing	100	ea	\$ 13.97	\$ 1,397.00	\$ 16.65	\$ 1,665.00	\$ 8.78	\$ 878.00		
42	46" x 120" x 22GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 10.61	\$ 1,061.00	\$ 19.15	\$ 1,915.00	\$ 12.13	\$ 1,213.00		
43	48" x 120" x 20GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 22.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 28.57	\$ 2,857.00	\$ 17.08	\$ 1,708.00		
44	48" x 96" x 20GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 4.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 3.70	\$ 370.00	\$ 3.27	\$ 327.00		
45	48" x 120" x 18GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 6.51	\$ 651.00	\$ 7.70	\$ 770.00	\$ 6.12	\$ 612.00		
46	48" x 96" x 18GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 16.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 16.04	\$ 1,604.00	\$ 15.94	\$ 1,594.00		
47	48" x 120" x 16GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 45.25	\$ 4,525.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 6,900.00	\$ 60.32	\$ 6,032.00		
48	48" x 96" x 16GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 16.28	\$ 1,628.00	\$ 15.29	\$ 1,529.00	No Bid	No Bid		
49	48" x 120" x 14GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 17.57	\$ 1,757.00	\$ 23.85	\$ 2,385.00	\$ 13.04	\$ 1,304.00		
50	48" x 96" x 14GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 12.95	\$ 1,295.00	\$ 14.88	\$ 1,488.00	\$ 16.41	\$ 1,641.00		
51	48" x 120" x 11GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 30.50	\$ 3,050.00	\$ 44.35	\$ 4,435.00	\$ 41.43	\$ 4,143.00		
52	48" x 96" x 11GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea	\$ 33.40	\$ 3,340.00	\$ 29.76	\$ 2,976.00	\$ 36.86	\$ 3,686.00		
Total Page				\$ 240,031.00		\$ 281,473.00		\$ 182,990.00			
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A				(State / Preference)		OK / N/A		OK / N/A		TX / Tied Bids	
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)											
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:			
						Lead time: 5-7 days		Lead time: 4 weeks			
Overall low bid awarded to Wheeler Metals of Tulsa, OK.				Buyer Tab Notes		Buyer Tab Notes		Buyer Tab Notes			