

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310018809				Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
Solicitation # 1310004097				Jupiter Aluminum Corporation, Hammond, IN			BSA Intercontinental, Irvine, CA			John R Wald Company, Huntingdon, PA		
Closing Date 2/14/2017												
Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO												
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
Aluminum Coil - Market				American Metal Market			American Metal Market			US Midwest Metal Values		
1	Used											
2	Fabrication Cost					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1st year pricing	210000 lb			\$ 0.58	\$ 121,800.00		1.735	\$ 364,350.00		\$ 0.58	\$ 121,800.00
	2nd year pricing	210000 lb			\$ 0.59	\$ 123,900.00		1.866	\$ 391,860.00		No Bid	No Bid
	3rd year pricing	210000 lb			\$ 0.60	\$ 126,000.00		2.006	\$ 421,260.00		No Bid	No Bid
				\$ -			\$ -			\$ -		
Total Page				\$ 371,700.00			\$ 1,177,470.00			\$ 121,800.00		
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)				IN / N/A			CA / Tied Bids			PA / Tied Bids		
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)												
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:		
Overall low bid awarded to Jupiter Aluminum Corporation of Hammond, IN.				Minimum Order: 40,000 lbs. Lead time: 30 days ARO.			Minimum Order: 34,000-40,000 lbs. Lead time: 30 days.			Minimum Order: 15,000 lbs. Lead time: 3 weeks ARO.		
				Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes		