

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #		1310018872		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address	
Solicitation #		1310004096		Albright Steel and Wire, Oklahoma City, OK		Buckeye Metals, Cleveland, OH		Wheeler Metals, Muskogee, OK		BSAI International, Irvine, CA		Priefert Manufacturing, Mount Pleasant, TX	
Closing Date		1/26/2017											
Buyer		Randy Pogue, CPO											
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension
1	STEEL: Angle Iron, Hot Rolled	2000	ea	\$ 11.63	\$ 23,260.00	\$ -	-	\$ 12.36	\$ 24,720.00	\$ 13.75	\$ 27,500.00	\$13.29	\$ 26,580.00
2	STEEL: Angle Iron, Hot Rolled	500	ea	\$ 28.90	\$ 14,450.00	\$ -	-	\$ 29.93	\$ 14,965.00	\$ 33.20	\$ 16,600.00	\$32.25	\$ 16,125.00
3	STEEL: Solid Round, Hot rolled	50	ea	\$ 3.43	\$ 171.50	\$ 5.50	\$ 275.00	\$ 5.20	\$ 260.00	\$ 5.50	\$ 275.00	\$ 4.10	\$ 205.00
4	STEEL: Flat Strip, Hot Rolled	100	ea	\$ 5.72	\$ 572.00	\$ -	-	\$ 5.40	\$ 540.00	\$ 7.25	\$ 725.00	\$ 4.66	\$ 466.00
5	STEEL: Flat Strip, Hot Rolled	50	ea	\$ 7.59	\$ 379.50	\$ -	-	\$ 8.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 10.25	\$ 512.50	\$ 8.13	\$ 406.50
6	STEEL: Sheet Temper Pass, Hot Rolled	500	ea	\$ 55.91	\$ 27,955.00	\$ 54.20	\$ 27,100.00	\$ 63.39	\$ 31,695.00	\$ 79.75	\$ 39,875.00	No Bid	No Bid
7	STEEL: Sheet Temper Pass, Hot Rolled	1500	ea	\$ 70.09	\$ 105,135.00	\$ 68.30	\$ 102,450.00	\$ 77.74	\$ 116,610.00	\$100.00	\$ 150,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
8	STEEL: Sheet Temper Pass, Hot Rolled	200	ea	\$ 88.29	\$ 17,658.00	\$ 84.80	\$ 16,960.00	\$ 96.69	\$ 19,338.00	\$120.15	\$ 24,030.00	No Bid	No Bid
9	STEEL: Sheet Temper Pass, Hot Rolled	100	ea	\$100.90	\$ 10,090.00	\$ 96.90	\$ 9,690.00	\$109.50	\$ 10,950.00	\$137.25	\$ 13,725.00	No Bid	No Bid
10	STEEL: Sheet Temper Pass, Hot Rolled	300	ea	\$105.42	\$ 31,626.00	\$102.00	\$ 30,600.00	\$117.34	\$ 35,202.00	\$144.00	\$ 43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
Total Page				\$ 231,297.00		\$ 187,075.00		\$ 254,680.00		\$ 316,442.50		\$ 43,782.50	
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)				OK / N/A		OH / N/A		OK / N/A		CA / Tied Bids			
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:		Supplier Remarks:	
				Lead time: 10 days		Lead time: 10 days		Lead time: 2-3 weeks		Lead time: 2 weeks-45 days		Lead time not listed.	
Buyer Tab Notes				Buyer Tab Notes		Buyer Tab Notes		Buyer Tab Notes		Buyer Tab Notes		Buyer Tab Notes	
Split award. Lines 1-5 awarded to Albright Steel and Wire of Oklahoma City, OK and Lines 6-10 awarded to Buckeye Metals of Columbus, OH. Splitting award saves \$5,664.00.						Lines 1, 2, 4 and 5, bid alternate sizes. Not evaluated.							