Oklahoma Department of Corrections
Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310018847 Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address
Solicitation # 1310004091
Closing Date 12/20/2016 DCW Casing, Mount Vernon, NY Globe Packaging Co, Carlstadt, NJ Sky Resources LLC, Columbus, OH
Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO
Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension
1 Frank Casing $ - $ - $ -
1st year pricing 3000000 ft 0.01739 $ 52,170.00 0.0176 $ 52,800.00 0.025 $ 75,000.00
2nd year pricing 3000000 ft 0.01739 $ 52,170.00 0.0182 $ 54,600.00 0.0255 $ 76,500.00
3rd year pricing 3000000 ft 0.01739 $ 52,170.00 0.0202 $ 60,600.00 0.0256 $ 76,800.00
2 Hot Link Casing $ - $ - $ -
1st year pricing 1680000 ft No bid No bid 0.0272 $ 45,696.00 0.036 $ 60,480.00
2nd year pricing 1680000 ft No bid No bid 0.028 $  47,040.00 0.0365 $ 61,320.00
3rd year pricing 1680000 ft No bid No bid 0.031 $  52,080.00 0.037 $ 62,160.00
Total Page $ 156,510.00 $ 312,816.00 $ 412,260.00
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) NY / Tied Bids NJ / Tied Bids OH /5%

[VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

Bid Awarded to

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Split award. Line 1 awarded to DCW Casing LLC of Mount
Vernon, NY and Line 2 awarded to Sky Resources LLC of
Columbus, OH. Splitting award saves an estimated $630.00 in year
1, $2,430.00 in year 2 and $8,430.00 in year 3, a total of $11,490
over the life of the contract.

Lead time: 2 weeks

Lead time: 1 week

Lead time: 12 weeks

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes




