

Oklahoma Department of Corrections  
 Contracts & Acquisitions Unit  
 Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #	<b>1310018787</b>			Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address	
Solicitation #	<b>1310004081</b>			Schaller Hardwood, Poplar Bluff, MO		Macdonald and Owen Veneer, Sparta, WI		Phoenix Hardwood and Plywood, Oklahoma City, OK		AF Potts Lumber Sales, Nashville, TN	
Closing Date	<b>11/1/2016</b>										
Buyer	<b>Randy Pogue, CPO</b>										
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension
1	LUMBER:4/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	2045	BF	\$ 2.14	\$ 4,376.30	\$ 2.15	\$ 4,396.75	\$ 2.70	\$ 5,521.50	2.285	\$ 4,672.83
2	LUMBER:5/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	4843	BF	\$ 2.42	\$ 11,720.06	\$ 2.47	\$ 11,962.21	\$ 3.30	\$ 15,981.90	\$ 2.53	\$ 12,252.79
3	LUMBER:6/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	6018	BF	\$ 2.96	\$ 17,813.28	\$ 2.62	\$ 15,767.16	\$ 3.90	\$ 23,470.20	\$ 2.90	\$ 17,452.20
4	LUMBER:8/4 Hit & Miss, Planed, FAS 1-FACE, Red Oak Appalachian, Kiln dried	1343	BF	\$ 3.17	\$ 4,257.31	\$ 2.78	\$ 3,733.54	\$ 3.90	\$ 5,237.70	\$ 3.05	\$ 4,096.15
5	LUMBER:Poplar, hardwood, straight line rip-one edge 3/4	3500	BF	\$ 1.75	\$ 6,125.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.00	\$ 7,000.00	1.755	\$ 6,142.50
6	LUMBER:Poplar, hardwood, straight line rip-one edge 3/4	8000	BF	\$ 1.78	\$ 14,240.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.10	\$ 16,800.00	\$ 1.80	\$ 14,400.00
7	LUMBER:Poplar, hardwood, straight line rip-one edge 3/4	4000	BF	\$ 1.82	\$ 7,280.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.20	\$ 8,800.00	1.855	\$ 7,420.00
8	PLYWOOD:Pine 5/8 X 4' X 8', 5 layer cross-grain, Exterior AC	140	SH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.00	\$ 4,340.00	\$ 38.24	\$ 5,353.60
9	3/4" x 4' x 8' Red Oak Veneer, A-1, Cabinet Grade, Clear 2-Sides	100	SH	\$ 49.00	\$ 4,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 59.50	\$ 5,950.00	\$ 67.43	\$ 6,743.00
10	3/4" x 4' x 8' China Birch Plywood, B-2, Cabinet Grade, Sanded	200	SH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.50	\$ 6,300.00	\$ 68.07	\$ 13,614.00
<b>Total Page</b>				<b>\$ 70,711.95</b>		<b>\$ 35,859.66</b>		<b>\$ 99,401.30</b>		<b>\$ 92,147.07</b>	
<b>RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A</b>	<b>(State / Preference)</b>			<b>MO / Tied Bids</b>		<b>WI / N/A</b>		<b>OK / N/A</b>		<b>TN / Tied Bids</b>	
<b>VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)</b>											
<b>Bid Awarded to</b>				<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>		<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>		<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>		<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>	
Split award. Lines 1, 2, 5, 6, 7 and 9 awarded to Schaller Hardwood of Poplar Bluff, MO. Lines 3-4 awarded to MacDonald and Owen Veneer and Lumber Co. Lines 8 and 10 awarded to Phoenix Hardwood and Plywood of Oklahoma City, OK.				Lead time: 1 week		Lead time: 3 weeks or sooner.		Lead time: 1 week		Lead time: 14 days	
				<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>		<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>		<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>		<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>	
				Bid C-2 on line 10. Specifications stated B-2.							