

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # Solicitation # Closing Date Buyer				Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
				Quikservice Steel Co of Tulsa, Tulsa, OK			Preifert Manufacturing Co, Mount Pleasant, TX		
				Quikservice Steel Co of Tulsa, Tulsa, OK			Preifert Manufacturing Co, Mount Pleasant, TX		
				Quikservice Steel Co of Tulsa, Tulsa, OK			Preifert Manufacturing Co, Mount Pleasant, TX		
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
1	3/4" x 20' C1018 Solid Round	100	ea		\$ 17.81	\$ 1,781.00		\$ 19.50	\$ 1,950.00
2	1" x 20' CR C1018 Solid Round	100	ea		\$ 31.71	\$ 3,171.00		\$ 34.71	\$ 3,471.00
3	1" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea		\$ 5.83	\$ 583.00		\$ 6.17	\$ 617.00
4	1-1/2" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea		\$ 9.03	\$ 903.00		\$ 9.54	\$ 954.00
5	2" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea		\$ 11.86	\$ 1,186.00		\$ 12.54	\$ 1,254.00
6	2-1/2" x 1/4" x 20' A36 Angle Iron	100	ea		\$ 27.76	\$ 2,776.00		\$ 30.30	\$ 3,030.00
7	3/4" x .065" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea		\$ 6.04	\$ 604.00		\$ 5.82	\$ 582.00
8	1" x .065" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea		\$ 7.71	\$ 771.00		\$ 7.58	\$ 758.00
9	1" x .120" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea		\$ 12.71	\$ 1,271.00		\$ 11.34	\$ 1,134.00
10	1-1/2" x .065" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea		\$ 11.88	\$ 1,188.00		\$ 11.63	\$ 1,163.00
11	1-1/2" x .083" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea		\$ 14.79	\$ 1,479.00		\$ 12.63	\$ 1,263.00
12	2" x .120" x 20' A513 Square Tubing	100	ea		\$ 27.08	\$ 2,708.00		\$ 24.22	\$ 2,422.00
13	48" x 72" x 3/16" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 54.39	\$ 5,439.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	60" x 67" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 46.46	\$ 4,646.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	60" x 84" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 58.24	\$ 5,824.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	60" x 96" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 66.56	\$ 6,656.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	72" x 84" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 69.89	\$ 6,989.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	72" x 96" x 10GA A1011 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 79.88	\$ 7,988.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	48" x 96" x 3/16" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 72.51	\$ 7,251.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	48" x 78" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 78.53	\$ 7,853.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	48" x 87" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 87.59	\$ 8,759.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	48" x 96" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 96.65	\$ 9,665.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	60" x 78" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 98.16	\$ 9,816.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	60" x 84" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 105.72	\$ 10,572.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	60" x 96" x 1/4" A36 Temper Pass, Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 120.82	\$ 12,082.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	48" x 96" x 3/4" x #9 Expanded Metal-Flat	100	sh		\$ 30.00	\$ 3,000.00		\$ 40.00	\$ 4,000.00
27	1" x 1/8" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea		\$ 3.45	\$ 345.00		\$ 2.68	\$ 268.00
28	1" x 1/4" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea		\$ 6.29	\$ 629.00		\$ 5.36	\$ 536.00
29	1-1/4" x 3/8" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea		\$ 12.42	\$ 1,242.00		\$ 14.66	\$ 1,466.00
30	2" x 1" x 20' A36 Flat Strip	100	ea		\$ 49.80	\$ 4,980.00		\$ 53.58	\$ 5,358.00
31	2" x 21' Sch40 Black Pipe, Plain End	100	ea		\$ 33.47	\$ 3,347.00		\$ 35.44	\$ 3,544.00
32	1" x .049" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 6.67	\$ 667.00		\$ 4.51	\$ 451.00
33	1" x .083" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 8.33	\$ 833.00		\$ 5.37	\$ 537.00
34	1" x .120" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 11.25	\$ 1,125.00		\$ 8.83	\$ 883.00
35	1-1/4" x .083" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 10.63	\$ 1,063.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36	1-1/2" x .065" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 10.42	\$ 1,042.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37	1-1/2" x .083" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 12.92	\$ 1,292.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38	1-1/2" x .120" x 20' A513 Round Tubing	100	ea		\$ 17.50	\$ 1,750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
39	1-1/2" x 3/4" x .083" x 20' A513 Rectangular Tubing	100	ea		\$ 13.54	\$ 1,354.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
40	1-1/2" x 1" x .083" x 20' A513 Rectangular Tubing	100	ea		\$ 15.25	\$ 1,525.00		\$ 11.59	\$ 1,159.00
41	2" x 1" x .083" x 20' A513 Rectangular Tubing	100	ea		\$ 15.00	\$ 1,500.00		\$ 9.84	\$ 984.00
42	46" x 120" x 22GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 27.60	\$ 2,760.00		\$ 19.12	\$ 1,912.00
43	48" x 120" x 20GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 26.19	\$ 2,619.00		\$ 20.40	\$ 2,040.00
44	48" x 96" x 20GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 20.95	\$ 2,095.00		\$ 16.32	\$ 1,632.00
45	48" x 120" x 18GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 34.92	\$ 3,492.00		\$ 27.20	\$ 2,720.00
46	48" x 96" x 18GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 27.93	\$ 2,793.00		\$ 21.76	\$ 2,176.00
47	48" x 120" x 16GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 35.94	\$ 3,594.00		\$ 34.00	\$ 3,400.00
48	48" x 96" x 16GA A1008 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 28.75	\$ 2,875.00		\$ 27.20	\$ 2,720.00
49	48" x 120" x 14GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 40.30	\$ 4,030.00		\$ 42.50	\$ 4,250.00
50	48" x 96" x 14GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 32.24	\$ 3,224.00		\$ 34.00	\$ 3,400.00
51	48" x 120" x 11GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 59.17	\$ 5,917.00		\$ 70.00	\$ 7,000.00
52	48" x 96" x 11GA A1011 Temper Pass Sheet Steel	100	ea		\$ 47.33	\$ 4,733.00		\$ 56.00	\$ 5,600.00
Total Page					\$ 185,787.00			\$ 74,634.00	
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A				(State / Preference)			OK / N/A		
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)							TX / Tied Bids		
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:		
Split award. Lines 1-6, 13-26, 29-31, 35-39 and 49-52 awarded to Quikservice Steel Co of Tulsa of Tulsa, OK. Lines 7-12, 27, 28, 32-34 and 40-48 awarded to Priefert Manufacturing Co of Mount Pleasant, TX. Splitting award saves an estimated \$6,937.00.				Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes		