

Oklahoma Department of Corrections
 Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
 Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310018559				Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
Solicitation # 1310004044				Curtis Restaurant Supply			Cooks Direct, Inc			Arctic Food Equipment		
Closing Date 6/20/2016				6577 E 40th St			27725 Diehl Rd			1501 S Enterprise		
Buyer David Williams, CPO 63351				Tulsa, OK 74145			Warrenville, IL 60555			Springfield, MO 65804		
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
1	Floor Mixer, Univex Planetary SRM40 or an approved equal	1	ea		\$ 5,500.23 ✓	5,500.23		\$ 6,855.15	6,855.15		\$ 5,830.74	5,830.74
2	Food Slicer, Globe Model G12 or an approved equal	1	ea		\$ 1,289.37	\$ 1,289.37		\$ 1,160.00 ✓	1,160.00		\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,400.00
3	Evaporator and Condensing Unit, Trenton or an approved equal	1	ea		no bid	\$ -		no bid	\$ -		no bid	\$ -
4	Standard Steam Table, Duke Manufacturing E-6-CBPG or an approved equal	1	ea		\$ 2,855.85 ✓	2,855.85		\$ 3,680.68	\$ 3,680.68		\$ 4,256.41	\$ 4,256.41
5	Slotted Steam Table / Hotel Pan Cover	65	ea		\$ 7.86 ✓	\$ 510.90		\$ 11.99	\$ 779.35		\$ 14.33	\$ 931.45
6	Convection Oven, Southbend Model No SLGS/22CCH or an approved equal	1	ea		\$ 7,879.78	\$ 7,879.78		\$ 7,433.75 ✓	7,433.75		\$ 7,741.46	\$ 7,741.46
7	Countertop Ice Dispenser, Scotsman Model No ID200B-1 or an approved equal	1	ea		\$ 3,246.92	\$ 3,246.92		\$ 3,021.00 ✓	3,021.00		\$ 3,206.78	\$ 3,206.78
8	Foodservice Disposer, InSinkErator Model No SS-1000 or an approved equal	1	ea		\$ 4,317.06	\$ 4,317.06		\$ 4,218.56 ✓	4,218.56		\$ 4,307.34	\$ 4,307.34
Total Page						\$ 25,600.11			\$ 27,148.49			\$ 27,674.18
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)				OK - n/a			IL - tie bids					
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)				Yes			Yes					
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:		
Split award. Lines 1, 4, 5 awarded to Curtis Restaurant Supply of Tulsa, OK. Lines 2, 6, 7, 8 awarded to Cooks Direct, Inc of Warrenville, IL. Splitting award results in a savings of \$899.82.				Lead time 5 weeks. Items bid: 1. Univex SRM40+. 2. Globe G12. 3. No bid. 4. Duke E-6-CBPG. 6. Southbend SLGS/22CCH. 7. Scotsman Model No ID200B-1. 8. InSinkErator Model No SS-1000.			Lead time 6 weeks. Items bid: 1. Globe SP40 2yr parts 1yr labor. 2. Globe G12. 3. No bid. 4. Duke E-6-CBPG. 6. Southbend SLGS/22CCH. 7. Scotsman Model No ID200B-1. 8. InSinkErator Model No SS-1000.			Lead time 30 days. Items bid: 1. Univex SRM40. 2. Globe G12. 3. No bid. 4. Duke E-6-CBPG. 6. Southbend SLGS/22CCH. 7. Scotsman Model No ID200B-1. 8. InSinkErator Model No SS-1000.		
				Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes		