

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #	<b>1310018488</b>			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
Solicitation #	<b>1310004027</b>			Advanced Educational Products, Inc, Buffalo, NY			Perma-Books, Jacksonville, IL			Mark My Words, LLC, Tempe, AZ			McGraw-Hill School Education, Columbus, OH		
Closing Date	<b>5/26/2016</b>														
Buyer	<b>Randy Pogue, CPO</b>														
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
1	Books	1	EA		See price list	See price list		See price list	See price list		See price list	See price list			
						\$ -			\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
<b>Total Page</b>						\$ -			\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
<b>RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A</b> (State / Preference)															
<b>VENDOR REGISTERED?</b> (Y / N)															
<b>Bid Awarded to</b>				<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>			<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>			<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>			<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>		
Split award. See price list for items that were split and pricing. In accordance with Oklahoma Administrative Code 260:115-7-36(d), the items that were tied in pricing between Advanced Educational Products and Mark My Words LLC were settled by a coin toss. Advanced Education Products won said coin toss.															
				<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>			<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>			<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>			<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>		
													Did not fill out price list included with solicitation. Responded on separate vendor quote. Non-responsive bid.		

Publisher	Name	ISBN	Walker Bookstore/Mark My Woods			Advanced Educational Products			Perma-Books			Facility		
			Quantity	Price	Total	Facility	Quantity	Price	Total	Facility	Quantity		Price	Total
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Math Geometry and Measurement Beginning WB	13/EAN:9780544790995	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Math Number Sense Beginning WB	9780544790988	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Math Number Sense Literacy WB	9780544790896	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Comprehension Intermediate WB	9780544790742	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Writing Grammar and Mechanics Beginning WB	9780544790780	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Writing Vocabulary and Composition Literacy WB	9780544790773	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Comprehension Literacy WB	9780544790704	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Phonics and Vocabulary Beginning WB	9780544790711	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Comprehension and Ref Skills Beginning WB	9780544790728	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Vocabulary and Ref Skills Intermediate WB	9780544790735	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Vocabulary Literacy WB	9780544790698	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	Fundamental Skills for Reading Phonics Literacy WB	9780544790681	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	14.95	44.85	OSR	3	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	GED Test Preparation Student Workbook Science	9780544274334	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	GED Test Preparation Student Workbook Social Studies	9780544274365	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	GED Test Preparation Student Workbook Reasoning Through Language Arts	9780544274310	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	No Bid	OSR	
Steck-Vaughn	GED Test Preparation Student Workbook Mathematical Reasoning	9780544274341	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	21.65	43.30	OSR	2	No Bid	OSR	
Saxon	Phonics Intervention Student Workbook	9781565772311	2	29.05	58.10	OSR	2	29.05	58.10	OSR	2	23.17	46.34	OSR
Houghton Mifflin	English Workbook Plus: Practice and Enrichment Grade 4	9780395502921	2	28.55	57.10	OSR	2	28.55	57.10	OSR	2	22.81	45.62	OSR
Harcourt School	Math Practice Workbook Student Edition Grade 3	9780153364754	1	7.00	7.00	OSR	1	12.25	12.25	OSR	1	9.79	9.79	OSR
Harcourt School	Math Practice Workbook Student Edition Grade 4	9780153567612	1	19.95	19.95	OSR	1	11.95	11.95	OSR	1	9.31	9.31	OSR
Houghton Mifflin	English Workbook Plus: Practice and Enrichment Grade 3	9780395502914	1	31.95	31.95	OSR	1	28.55	28.55	OSR	1	22.81	22.81	OSR
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Math D	ISBN 0077044695	25		No Bid	BJCC	25	22.43	560.75	BJCC	25		No Bid	BJCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success in Language Level D	ISBN 0077044572	5		No Bid	BJCC	5	22.43	112.15	BJCC	5		No Bid	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Language Arts Writing Exercise Book	ISBN 0739836064	50	14.95	747.50	BJCC	50		No Bid	BJCC	50	11.86	593.00	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Language Arts Reading Exercise Book	ISBN 0739836048	50	14.95	747.50	BJCC	50		No Bid	BJCC	50	11.86	593.00	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Science Exercise Book	ISBN 0739836021	50	14.95	747.50	BJCC	50		No Bid	BJCC	50	11.86	593.00	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Mathematics Exercise Book	ISBN 073983603X	50	14.95	747.50	BJCC	50		No Bid	BJCC	50	11.86	593.00	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Social Studies Exercise Book	ISBN 0739836056	50	14.95	747.50	BJCC	50		No Bid	BJCC	50	11.86	593.00	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Math	9780739828359	30	18.50	555.00	BJCC	30		No Bid	BJCC	30		No Bid	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Social Studies	ISBN 0739828347	25	18.50	462.50	BJCC	25		No Bid	BJCC	25	11.58	289.50	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Writing	9780739828311	25	18.50	462.50	BJCC	25		No Bid	BJCC	25	11.58	289.50	BJCC
Steck-Vaughn/Harcourt	GED Reading	ISBN 0739828363	25	18.50	462.50	BJCC	25		No Bid	BJCC	25	11.58	289.50	BJCC
McGraw Hill	Collins top 50 writing skills for GED success Text w/o CD-ROM (2006)	9780077044787	2	24.95	49.90	JEHCC	2	18.40	36.80	JEHCC	2	15.02	30.04	JEHCC
McGraw Hill	Mitchell and Emery Top 50 Math Skills for GED Success TEXT w.o CD-ROM (2004)	9780072973839	2	24.95	49.90	JEHCC	2	18.40	36.80	JEHCC	2	15.02	30.04	JEHCC
McGraw Hill	Gallagher Top 50 "Reading Skills for GED success Text w/o CD-ROM (2006)	9780077044817	2	24.95	49.90	JEHCC	2	18.40	36.80	JEHCC	2	15.02	30.04	JEHCC
McGraw Hill	Collins top 50 writing skills for GED success Text w/o CD-ROM (2006)	9780077044787	2	24.95	49.90	EWCC	2	18.40	36.80	EWCC	2	15.02	30.04	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Mitchell and Emery Top 50 Math Skills for GED Success TEXT w.o CD-ROM (2004)	9780072973839	2	24.95	49.90	EWCC	2	18.40	36.80	EWCC	2	15.02	30.04	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Gallagher Top 50 "Reading Skills for GED success Text w/o CD-ROM (2006)	9780077044817	2	24.95	49.90	EWCC	2	18.40	36.80	EWCC	2	15.02	30.04	EWCC
	<b>Real Number Series, (six books</b>	ISBN9780809238941	2	104.95	209.90				-				-	
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Measurement	978080924 2085	2		Bid complete set	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Algebra Basics	978080924 2092	2		Bid complete set	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Geometry Basics	978080924 2108	2		Bid complete set	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Fractions and Percents	978080924 2122	2		Bid complete set	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Whole Numbers and Decimals	978080924 2146	2		Bid complete set	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Tables, Graphs and Data	978080924 2177	2		Bid complete set	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC	2		No Bid	EWCC
Steck-Vaughn	Basic Essentials of Mathematics - Book 2- Percent, Measurement, Formulas, Equations, Ration an	ISBN 0811446697	50		21.50	EWCC	50	11.66	583.00	EWCC	50		No Bid	EWCC
	<b>Remarkable Personal Stories Collection (20 books)</b>				-				-				-	
	BROTHER TO BROTHER	1-59194-178-4	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	EVERYDAY HEROES	0-944210-28-4	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.90	58.00	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	FACING ADDICTION	1-59194-058-3	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	GUADALUPE QUINTANILLA	1-59194-269-1	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	IT COULDN'T HAPPEN TO ME	1-59194-049-4	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	La VIDA REAL	1-59194-179-2	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	LETTERS MY MOTHER NEVER READ	1-59194-036-2	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.90	58.00	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	MAKING THE MOST OF YOUR LIFE	1-59194-090-7	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.90	58.00	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	MARIA CARDENAS	978-1-59194-418-8	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	READING CHANGED MY LIFE	1-59194-012-5	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.90	58.00	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	ROBERTO CLEMENTE	1-59194-103-2	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	ROD SUTTON	978-1-59194-419-5	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	SURVIVING ABUSE	1-59194-419-5	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	TEN REAL LIFE STORIES	1-59194-059-1	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.90	58.00	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	THE AMAZING HARRY HOUDINI	1-59194-175-X	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	SISTER TO SISTER	1-59194-504-7	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	THE STOLEN LIGHT	1-59194-095-8	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	THE STORY OF BLIMA	1-59194-051-6	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC

	UNEXPECTED BLESSINGS	1-59194-238-1	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	VOCES LATINAS	1-59194-225-X	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	3.72	74.40	EWCC
	<b>Complete Bluford Series (21 books)</b>													
					-				-				-	
Townsend Press	LOST AND FOUND	0-944210-02-3	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	MATTER OF TRUST	0-944210-03-1	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SECRETS IN THE SHADOWS	0-944210-05-8	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SOMEONE TO LOVE ME	0-944210-06-6	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	THE BULLY	0-944210-00-7	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	THE GUN	0-944210-04-X	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	UNTIL WE MEET AGAIN	0-944210-07-4	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	BLOOD IS THICKER	1-59194-016-8	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	BROTHERS IN ARMS	1-59194-017-6	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SUMMER OF SECRETS	1-59194-018-4	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	THE FALLEN	1-59194-066-4	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SHATTERED	1-59194-069-9	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SEARCH FOR SAFETY	1-59194-070-2	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	NO WAY OUT	1-59194-176-8	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SCHOOLED	1-59194-177-6	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	BREAKING POINT	1-59194-232-2	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	PRETTY UGLY	1-59194-233-0	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	THE TEST	1-59194-234-9	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	PROMISES TO KEEP	1-59194-303-5	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	SURVIVOR	1-59194-304-3	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
Townsend Press	GIRLS LIKE ME	978-1-59194-470-6	20	5.95	119.00	EWCC	20	2.88	57.60	EWCC	20	10.04	200.80	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Key to Fractions set of Books 1-4	9781559531009	20	22.95	459.00	EWCC	20	17.23	344.60	EWCC	20		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 8: Graphs	9781559530088	10	9.95	99.50	EWCC	10	4.56	45.60	EWCC	10		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 3: Equations	9781559530033	10	9.95	99.50	EWCC	10	4.56	45.60	EWCC	10		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 2: Variables, Terms, and Expressions	9781559530026	10	9.95	99.50	EWCC	10	4.56	45.60	EWCC	10		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 1: Operations on Integers	9781559530019	10	9.95	99.50	EWCC	10	4.56	45.60	EWCC	10		No Bid	EWCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	5500 Whole Numbers Skill Book 10 pack	ISBN 0811465306	3		No Bid	EWCC	3	23.82	71.46	EWCC	3		No Bid	EWCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	6600 Fractions Skill Book 10 pack	ISBN 0811465314	3	9.95	29.85	EWCC	3	2.82	8.46	EWCC	3		No Bid	EWCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Math M	ISBN 0077044688	20		No Bid	EWCC	20	22.43	448.60	EWCC	20		No Bid	EWCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	TABE Fundamentals Level M computation	978-1-419-05355-9	20	18.50	370.00	EWCC	20	10.10	202.00	EWCC	20	13.75	275.00	EWCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	TABE Fundamentals Level M applied math	978-1-419-05354-2	20	18.50	370.00	EWCC	20	10.10	202.00	EWCC	20	18.33	366.60	EWCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	Basic Essentials of Mathematics - Book 1	978-0-811-44668-6	20	20.95	419.00	EWCC	20	11.66	233.20	EWCC	20	17.26	345.20	EWCC
	<b>Voyager: Reading and Writing for Today's Adults</b>													
					-				-				-	
New Reader Press	Introduction Student Book	9781564209092	3		No Bid	LCC	3	16.11	48.33	LCC	3	11.19	33.57	LCC
New Reader Press	Introduction teachers guide	9781564209139	1		No Bid	LCC	1	11.51	11.51	LCC	1	7.99	7.99	LCC
New Reader Press	Level 1 student book	9781564209108	3		No Bid	LCC	3	16.11	48.33	LCC	3	11.19	33.57	LCC
New Reader Press	Level 1 teachers guide	9781564209146	1		No Bid	LCC	1	11.51	11.51	LCC	1	7.99	7.99	LCC
New Reader Press	Level 2 student book	9781564209115	3		No Bid	LCC	3	16.11	48.33	LCC	3	11.19	33.57	LCC
New Reader Press	Level 2 teachers guide	9781564209153	1		No Bid	LCC	1	11.51	11.51	LCC	1	7.99	7.99	LCC
New Reader Press	Level 3 student book	9781564209122	3		No Bid	LCC	3	16.11	48.33	LCC	3		No Bid	LCC
New Reader Press	Level 3 teachers guide	9781564209160	1		No Bid	LCC	1	11.51	11.51	LCC	1		No Bid	LCC
	<b>Focus on Phonics</b>													
					-				-				-	
New Reader Press	Workbook 1	9781564209429	3		No Bid	LCC	3	12.95	38.85	LCC	3	8.99	26.97	LCC
New Reader Press	Teachers edition 1	9781564209467	1		No Bid	LCC	1	12.66	12.66	LCC	1	8.79	8.79	LCC
New Reader Press	Workbook 2	9781564209436	3		No Bid	LCC	3	14.10	42.30	LCC	3	9.79	29.37	LCC
New Reader Press	Teachers edition 2	9781564209474	1		No Bid	LCC	1	13.81	13.81	LCC	1	9.59	9.59	LCC
New Reader Press	Workbook 3	9781564209443	3		No Bid	LCC	3	12.95	38.85	LCC	3	8.99	26.97	LCC
New Reader Press	Teachers edition 3	9781564209481	1		No Bid	LCC	1	12.66	12.66	LCC	1	8.79	8.79	LCC
New Reader Press	Workbook 4	9781564209450	3		No Bid	LCC	3	12.95	38.85	LCC	3	8.99	26.97	LCC
New Reader Press	Teachers edition 4	9781564209498	1		No Bid	LCC	1	12.66	12.66	LCC	1	8.79	8.79	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	5500 Whole Numbers Skill Book 10 pack	ISBN 0811465306	10		No Bid	LCC	10	23.82	238.20	LCC	10	3.24	32.40	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	6600 Fractions Skill Book 10 pack	ISBN 0811465314	8	9.95	79.60	LCC	8	2.82	22.56	LCC	8	3.84	30.72	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	7700 Decimals Skill Book 10 pack	ISBN 0811465322	4		No Bid	LCC	4	23.82	95.28	LCC	4	3.68	14.72	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	8800 Solving Word Problems Skill Book 10 pack	ISBN 0811465330	5		No Bid	LCC	5	23.92	119.60	LCC	5	3.68	18.40	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	Capitalization/Punctuation/Writing Convention	ISBN 0811465083	2	9.95	19.90	LCC	2	2.82	5.64	LCC	2		No Bid	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	PreGED Language Arts-Reading	ISBN 0739866974	5	18.95	94.75	LCC	5		No Bid	LCC	5	14.82	74.10	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	PreGED Language Arts-Writing	ISBN 0739866966	5	18.95	94.75	LCC	5		No Bid	LCC	5	14.82	74.10	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	PreGED Mathematics	ISBN 0739866982	5	18.95	94.75	LCC	5		No Bid	LCC	5	14.82	74.10	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	PreGED Science	ISBN 0739867008	5	18.95	94.75	LCC	5		No Bid	LCC	5	14.82	74.10	LCC
Steck-Vaughn/Houghton Mifflin	PreGED Social Studies	ISBN 0739866990	5	18.95	94.75	LCC	5		No Bid	LCC	5	14.82	74.10	LCC
	<b>Contemporary Achieving TABE Success</b>													
					-	LCC			-	LCC			-	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Math E	ISBN 0077044673	2	28.95	57.90	LCC	2	22.43	44.86	LCC	2	20.57	41.14	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Math M	ISBN 0077044688	6		No Bid	LCC	6	22.43	134.58	LCC	6	13.83	82.98	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Math D	ISBN 0077044695	6		No Bid	LCC	6	22.43	134.58	LCC	6		No Bid	LCC

McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reading E Workbook	ISBN 0077044596	2		No Bid	LCC	2	22.43	44.86	LCC	2		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reading M Workbook	ISBN 0077044602	4		No Bid	LCC	4	22.43	89.72	LCC	4		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reading D Workbook	ISBN 0077044619	5		No Bid	LCC	5	22.43	112.15	LCC	5		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reading A Workbook	ISBN 0077044626	4		No Bid	LCC	4	22.43	89.72	LCC	4		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Language E	ISBN 0077044558	2		No Bid	LCC	2	22.43	44.86	LCC	2		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Language M	ISBN 0077044565	4		No Bid	LCC	4	22.43	89.72	LCC	4		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Language D	ISBN 0077044572	6		No Bid	LCC	6	22.43	134.58	LCC	6		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reader Level E	ISBN 0077044633	4		No Bid	LCC	4	17.83	71.32	LCC	4		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reader Level M	ISBN 0077044640	2		No Bid	LCC	2	17.83	35.66	LCC	2		No Bid	LCC
McGraw Hill Contemporary	Achieving TABE Success Reader Level D	ISBN 0077044657	2	24.95	49.90	LCC	2	17.83	35.66	LCC	2	12.38	24.76	LCC
McGraw Hill	Key to Percents set of Books 1-3	9781559530897	20	19.95	399.00	MACC	20	12.64	252.80	MACC	20	7.71	154.20	MACC
McGraw Hill	Key to Fractions set of Books 1-4	9781559531009	20	23.95	479.00	MACC	20	17.23	344.60	MACC	20	10.26	205.20	MACC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 8: Graphs	9781559530088	10	9.95	99.50	MACC	10	4.56	45.60	MACC	10	2.97	29.70	MACC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 3: Equations	9781559530033	10	9.95	99.50	MACC	10	4.56	45.60	MACC	10	2.44	24.40	MACC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 2: Variables, Terms, and Expressions	9781559530026	10	9.95	99.50	MACC	10	4.56	45.60	MACC	10	2.98	29.80	MACC
McGraw Hill	Key to Algebra Book 1: Operations on Integers	9781559530019	10	9.95	99.50	MACC	10	4.56	45.60	MACC	10	2.97	29.70	MACC
	<b>Picture the Past: U.S. History Book Set (Set of 9 Books)</b>						1	80.55	80.55					
National School Products	Life on the Underground Railroad		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life in San Francisco's Chinatown		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life at the Alamo		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life on a Pioneer Homestead		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life on a Southern Plantation		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life on the Oregon Trail		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life in Colonial Boston		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life in New Amsterdam		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Life in a Mississippi river Town		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
	<b>Fierce Fighters Paperback Book Set (7 books)</b>						1	57.53	57.53					
National School Products	Vikings		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
National School Products	Gladiators		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
National School Products	Medieval Knights		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
National School Products	Ninja		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
National School Products	Samurai		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
National School Products	Greek Warriors		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
National School Products	Aztec Warriors		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	20.67	20.67	HMCC
	<b>Classic Starts Library (Set of 30 books)</b>						1	217.51	217.51					
National School Products	Anne of Green Gables		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	4.76	4.76	HMCC
National School Products	Black Beauty		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Adventures of Tom Sawyer		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Adventures of Sherlock Holmes		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Little Women		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Adventures of Robin Hood		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Call of the Wild		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Little Princess		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Treasure Island		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Secret Garden		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Adventures of Huckleberry Finn		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	White Fang		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	20,000 Leagues under the Sea		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Story of King Arthur		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Gulliver's Travels		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Red Badge of Courage		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Robinson Crusoe		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Oliver Twist		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Frankenstein		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Strange Case/Jekyll & Hyde		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Prince and the Pauper		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	War of the Worlds		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Around the World in 80 Days		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Dracula		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Heidi		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Pollyanna		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Rebecca of Sunnybrook Farm		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
National School Products	Swiss Family Robinson		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	4.76	4.76	HMCC
National School Products	Three Musketeers		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
National School Products	Wind in the Willows		1		No Bid	HMCC	1		Bid complete set	HMCC	1	5.56	5.56	HMCC
	<b>The Heights (Classroom set of 5 books)</b>													
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Dive	9781616512828	1		No Bid	HMCC	1	9.15	9.15	HMCC	1	5.20	5.20	HMCC



New Reader Press Adult Ed	Neptune	9781616512859	1		No Bid	HMCC	1	9.15	9.15	HMCC	1	6.35	6.35	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Camp	9781616512842	1		No Bid	HMCC	1	9.15	9.15	HMCC	1	6.35	6.35	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Crash	9781616512835	1		No Bid	HMCC	1	9.15	9.15	HMCC	1	6.35	6.35	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	River	9781616512811	1		No Bid	HMCC	1	9.15	9.15	HMCC	1	5.20	5.20	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Easy Reader Biographies: Nelson Mandela		1		No Bid	HMCC	1	14.90	14.90	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Easy Reader Biographies: Martin Luther King Jr.		1		No Bid	HMCC	1	14.90	14.90	HMCC	1	2.39	2.39	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Easy Reader Biographies: Cesar Chavez		1		No Bid	HMCC	1	14.90	14.90	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Easy Reader Biographies: Rosa Parks		1		No Bid	HMCC	1	14.90	14.90	HMCC	1	2.39	2.39	HMCC
New Reader Press Adult Ed	Easy Reader Biographies: Mahatma Gandhi		1		No Bid	HMCC	1	14.90	14.90	HMCC	1		No Bid	HMCC
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Area 51	9781680210316	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Monsters of the Deep	9781680210286	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Terrorism	9781616519360	5		No Bid	OSP	5	10.30	51.50	OSP	5	7.15	35.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Wormholes	9781680210330	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Great Spies of the World	9781680210491	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	A Walk in the Park	9781622500437	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Shadows of Guilt	9781616510015	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	The Quality of Mercy	9781616510060	5		No Bid	OSP	5	11.45	57.25	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	True Crime Celebrity Cases	9781599054353	5		No Bid	OSP	5	10.30	51.50	OSP	5	7.15	35.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	To Catch a Dream	9781616512699	5		No Bid	OSP	5	5.73	28.65	OSP	5	7.95	39.75	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Steve Jobs	9781616518899	10		No Bid	OSP	10	9.15	91.50	OSP	10	5.98	59.80	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	The Civil Rights Movement and Vietnam	9781599053677	10		No Bid	OSP	10	5.73	57.30	OSP	10	7.48	74.80	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	The Best of Poe	9781562548841	10		No Bid	OSP	10	5.73	57.30	OSP	10	7.48	74.80	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	Romeo and Juliet	9781616511098	10		No Bid	OSP	10	5.73	57.30	OSP	10	7.48	74.80	OSP
Saddleback Educational Publishing	War of the Worlds	9781562649527	10		No Bid	OSP	10	11.45	114.50	OSP	10	18.76	187.60	OSP
Townsend Press	The Gun	094421004X	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.90	29.00	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Surviving Abuse: Four True Stories	1591940575	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.90	29.00	OSP	10	3.99	39.90	OSP
Townsend Press	The Scarlet Letter	1591940729	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	The Red Badge of Courage	1591940508	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Roberto Clemente: The Story of a Champion	1591941032	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Narrative of the Life of Frederick Douglass	1591940192	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.90	29.00	OSP	10	1.88	18.80	OSP
Townsend Press	The Mark of Zorro	1591940710	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.90	29.00	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Making the Most of Your Life	1591940907	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.90	29.00	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Letters My Mother Never Read	1591940362	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.90	29.00	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	King Arthur and His Knights	1591940745	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Hermanos en Armas (Bluford Series)	9781591944225	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Great Expectations	1591940605	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10		No Bid	OSP
Townsend Press	Great Moments in Sports	1591942705	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	1.88	18.80	OSP
Townsend Press	Frankenstein and the Strange Case of Dr. Jekyll and Mr. Hyde	1591940524	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10		No Bid	OSP
Townsend Press	The Deadliest War: The Story of World War II	1591942284	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	1.88	18.80	OSP
Townsend Press	Facing Addiction: Three True Stories	1591940583	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Townsend Press	Dracula	1591940036	10	5.95	59.50	OSP	10	2.88	28.80	OSP	10	3.72	37.20	OSP
Houghton Mifflin/Harcourt	GED Math 2002	9780739828359	12	19.10	229.20	JCCC	12		No Bid	JCCC	12		No Bid	JCCC
Houghton Mifflin/Harcourt	GED Language Arts-Writing	9780739828311	12	19.10	229.20	JCCC	12		No Bid	JCCC	12	11.58	138.96	JCCC
Houghton Mifflin/Harcourt	Pre-GED Language Arts	9780739866982	12		No Bid	JCCC	12		No Bid	JCCC	12		No Bid	JCCC
Houghton Mifflin/Harcourt	Pre-GED Mathematics	9780739866986	12	19.30	231.60	JCCC	12		No Bid	JCCC	12	14.82	177.84	JCCC