

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #	<b>1310018307</b>		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address		Vendor Name and Address				
Solicitation #	<b>1310004000</b>		K-O-K Products, Galena, OH		J Tech Sales, Boca Raton, FL		Brenntag Southwest, Tulsa, OK				
Closing Date	<b>2/17/2016</b>										
Buyer	<b>Randy Pogue, CPO</b>										
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension	Unit Cost	Extension		
1	Acrysol ICS-1, Acusol-820 thickener 305 active	475	lb	\$ 2.65	\$ 1,258.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
2	Lebonyx BC-2 or an approved equal - a blended liquid solvent that is compatible with IPA which aid drying and eliminating water spotting	42	lb	\$ 6.45	\$ 270.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
3	Activate SP-G - liquid surfactant non-ionic blend of emulsifiers, water, softeners, buffers and sequestrates.	45	lb	\$ 7.48	\$ 336.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
4	Lebonyx GP-36 100% active non-ironic liquid blend of surface active agents, modified diethanolamide and water softeners, sequestrants and binders. PH 9.2. Specific gravity 0.968.	84	lb	\$ 6.17	\$ 518.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
5	Proxel GXL or an approved equal.	135	lb	\$ 13.35	\$ 1,802.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
6	Detcon - Anionic and non-ionic blend of linear alcohol ethoxylated water softener, diethanolamid buffers and emulsifiers and sequestrants. PH of 1% solution 9.2. Specific gravity: 1.01. 35 to 50 lb pail	135	lb	\$ 6.62	\$ 893.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
7	Tinopal ams brightener or an approved equal	99	lb	\$ 12.75	\$ 1,262.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.25	\$ 1,410.75		
8	Monoisopropanolamine or an approved equal	2640	lb	\$ 3.05	\$ 8,052.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.15	\$ 8,316.00		
9	FD&C blue dye #1 or an approved equal	5	lb	\$ 73.60	\$ 368.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 235.00	No Bid	No Bid		
10	FD&C green dye #3 or an approved equal	5	lb	\$ 153.00	\$ 765.00	\$ 194.00	\$ 970.00	No Bid	No Bid		
11	Oleic acid or an approved equal	400	lb	\$ 1.05	\$ 420.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.35	\$ 540.00		
12	Witcamide 128T - foam stabilizer - Coco Diethanolamide	3150	lb	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.17	\$ 3,685.50	\$ 2.65	\$ 8,347.50		
13	Perfume softener oil	100	lb	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.95	\$ 995.00	No Bid	No Bid		
<b>Total Page</b>				<b>\$ 15,947.73</b>		<b>\$ 5,885.50</b>		<b>\$ 18,614.25</b>			
<b>RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A</b>			(State / Preference)	OH / N/A		FL / Tied Bids		OK / N/A			
<b>VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)</b>											
<b>Bid Awarded to</b>				<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>		<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>		<b>Supplier Remarks:</b>			
Split award. Lines 1-8, 10 & 11 awarded to K-O-K Products of Galena, OH and Lines 9, 12 & 13 awarded to J Tech Sales of Boca Raton, FL.						Lead time: 3-10 days ARO. Line 12: Bid Spectrum Surfactants- Spectramide 1:1 (as previously supplied).					
				<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>		<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>		<b>Buyer Tab Notes</b>			