

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #		1310017201		Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address					
Solicitation #		1310003899		K-O-K Products, Galena, OH			J. Tech Sales, Boca Raton, FL			Harcros Chemical, Tulsa, OK					
Closing Date		1/13/2015													
Buyer		Randy Pogue, CPO													
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension			
1	ACRYSOL ICS-1, ACUSOL-820 THICKENER 305 ACTIVE	475	LB		\$ 2.65	\$ 1,258.75	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
2	A BLENDED LIQUID SOLVENT THAT IS COMPATIBLE WITH I.P.A. WHICH AIDS DRYING AND ELIMINATING WATER SPOTTING	42	LB		\$ 6.45	\$ 270.90	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
3	ACTIVATE SP-G - LIQUID SURFACTANT NON-IONIC BLEND OF EMULSIFIERS, WATER, SOFTENERS, BUFFERS AND SEQUESTRATES.	45	LB		\$ 7.48	\$ 336.60	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
4	100% ACTIVE NON-IRONIC LIQUID BLEND OF SURFACE ACTIVE AGENTS, MODIFIED DIETHANOLAMIDE AND WATER SOFTENERS, SEQUESTERANTS AND BINDERS. PH 9.2 SPECIFIC GRAVITY 0.968.	85	LB		\$ 6.17	\$ 524.45	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
5	PROXEL GXL OR AN APPROVED EQUAL	135	LB		\$ 13.35	\$ 1,802.25	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
6	DETCON- ANOINIC AND NON-IONIC BLEND OF LINEAR ALCOHOL ETHOXYLATED WATER SOFTENER, DIETHANOLAMIDE BUFFERS AND EMULSIFIERS AND SEQUESTERANTS. PH OF 1% SOLUTION, 9.2 SPECIFIC GRAVITY: 1.01.	135	LB		\$ 6.62	\$ 893.70	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
7	TINOPAL AMS BRIGHTENER OR AN APPROVED EQUAL.	99	LB		\$ 12.75	\$ 1,262.25	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
8	MONOISOPROPANOLAMINE OR AN APPROVED EQUAL.	2640	LB		\$ 3.05	\$ 8,052.00	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
9	FD&C BLUE DYE #1 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL.	5	LB		\$ 73.60	\$ 368.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 235.00		No Bid	No Bid				
10	FD&C GREEN DYE #3 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL.	5	LB		\$ 158.50	\$ 792.50	\$ 194.00	\$ 970.00		No Bid	No Bid				
11	OLEIC ACID OR AN APPROVED EQUAL., OLEIC ACID LIGHT STRAW YELLOW COLOR.	400	LB		\$ 1.05	\$ 420.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 1.88	\$ 752.00				
12	EMULSIFIER SURFACTANT.	1350	LB		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
13	ACL-59 CHLORINATION CARRIER OR AN APPROVED EQUAL.	600	LB		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
Total Page					\$ 15,981.40		\$ 1,205.00			\$ 752.00					
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A				(State / Preference)			OH / N/A			FL / Tied Bids			OK / N/A		
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)															
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:					
Overall low bid awarded to K-O-K Products of Galena, OH.							Lead Time: 5-10 Days ARO			Lead Time: 2 Weeks					
				Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes					