

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #				1310016429			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
Solicitation #				1310003843			Brenntag Southwest, Sand Springs, OK			Harcros Chemical, Oklahoma City, OK		
Closing Date				5/29/2014								
Buyer				Randy Pogue, CPO								
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension			
1	CHEMICALS:Sodium Chloride, Evaporated Salt Food Grade	300	LB		\$ 0.18	\$ 54.00		\$ 0.19	\$ 57.00			
2	CHEMICALS:Sodium Metasilicate Pentahydrate	360	LB		\$ 0.41	\$ 147.60		\$ 0.42	\$ 151.20			
3	CHEMICALS:Sodium Triphosphate	2350	LB		\$ 0.90	\$ 2,115.00		\$ 0.92	\$ 2,162.00			
4	CHEMICALS:Witconate 1260	5000	LB		\$ 1.44	\$ 7,200.00		\$ 1.47	\$ 7,350.00			
5	WITCONATE AOS, ALPHA-OLEFIN-SULFANATE, 485 LB DRUM	4254	LB		\$ 0.85	\$ 3,615.90		\$ 0.69	\$ 2,935.26			
6	WITCONATE AOS, ALPHA-OLEFIN-SULFANAT, 410 LB DRUM	4510	LB		\$ 1.14	\$ 5,141.40		\$ 1.15	\$ 5,186.50			
7	ALCOHOL ETHOXYLATE	13810	LB		\$ 2.10	\$ 29,001.00		\$ 2.12	\$ 29,277.20			
8	ALCOHOL: ISOPROPYL ALCOHOL, ANHYDROUS 99% (ALSO) ISOPROPANOL, PROPAN-2-OL, 2-PROPANOL	360	LB		\$ 1.05	\$ 378.00		\$ 1.19	\$ 428.40			
9	SODIUM:50lb, Bicarbonate	450	LB		\$ 0.27	\$ 121.50		\$ 0.28	\$ 126.00			
10	CHEMICALS:Sodium Carbonate	450	LB		\$ 0.27	\$ 121.50		\$ 0.28	\$ 126.00			
11	CHEMICALS:Witconate 68KN	2880	LB		\$ 1.84	\$ 5,299.20		\$ 1.85	\$ 5,328.00			
12	TETRASODIUM EDTA - CIBAGEIGY CIBA	2400	LB		\$ 0.57	\$ 1,368.00		\$ 0.64	\$ 1,536.00			
13	HIGH ACTIVE PURITY FLAKE USED FOR DRY AND WET COMPOUNDING OF ALL-PURPOSE CLEANERS, HEAVY-DUTY LAUNDRY POWDERS AND SCOURING PADS.	400	LB		\$ 2.86	\$ 1,144.00		\$ 2.88	\$ 1,152.00			
14	LIPOLASE 100L, TYPE EX	220	LB		\$ 12.25	\$ 2,695.00	No Bid		No Bid			
15	SODIUM:55ga, Hypochlorite	6600	GA		\$ 1.20	\$ 7,920.00		\$ 1.95	\$ 12,870.00			
16	FLOOR FINISH: Metal Cross Linked 36% Concentrate	3920	LB		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
17	FLOOR FINISH:Floor sealer & wax,1ga,4in1 complete floor finish	7840	LB		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
Total Page						\$ 47,274.90				\$ 47,119.16		
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A				(State / Preference)			OK / N/A			OK / N/A		
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)												
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:				Supplier Remarks:				
				Lead Time: 3-5 Days								
Overall low bid awarded to Brenntag Southwest of Sand Springs, OK				Buyer Tab Notes				Buyer Tab Notes				