

Oklahoma Department of Corrections
 Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
 Bid Tabulation Sheet

Solicitation # Closing Date Buyer				Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address		
1310016241 1310003813 4/15/2014 Randy Pogue, CPO				Oklahoma Upholstery Supply, Tulsa, OK			Burch Fabrics, Grand Rapids, MI					
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
1	DECORATIVE TACKS					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	50 BX			\$ 24.95	\$ 1,247.50		\$ 12.58	\$ 629.00			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	50 BX			\$ 25.95	\$ 1,297.50		\$ 13.75	\$ 687.50			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	50 BX			\$ 26.95	\$ 1,347.50		\$ 13.75	\$ 687.50			\$ -
2	DENIM 50% POLYESTER					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	1000 YD			\$ 2.20	\$ 2,200.00		\$ 1.42	\$ 1,420.00			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	1000 YD			\$ 2.30	\$ 2,300.00		\$ 1.55	\$ 1,550.00			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	1000 YD			\$ 2.50	\$ 2,500.00		\$ 1.55	\$ 1,550.00			\$ -
3	COTTON FELT					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	25 LB			\$ 2.25	\$ 56.25		1.3628	\$ 34.07			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	25 LB			\$ 2.40	\$ 60.00		1.4896	\$ 37.24			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	25 LB			\$ 2.55	\$ 63.75		1.4896	\$ 37.24			\$ -
4	AUTOMOTIVE CARPET PAD					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	200 YD			\$ 6.25	\$ 1,250.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	200 YD			\$ 6.60	\$ 1,320.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	200 YD			\$ 6.80	\$ 1,360.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
5	MARSHALL SPRING UNIT					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	250 EA			\$ 37.95	\$ 9,487.50		\$ 14.74	\$ 3,685.00			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	250 EA			\$ 40.95	\$ 10,237.50		\$ 16.11	\$ 4,027.50			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	250 EA			\$ 42.95	\$ 10,737.50		\$ 16.11	\$ 4,027.50			\$ -
6	CANVAS					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	55 YD			\$ 6.75	\$ 371.25		\$ 2.59	\$ 142.45			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	55 YD			\$ 6.95	\$ 382.25		\$ 2.83	\$ 155.65			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	55 YD			\$ 7.25	\$ 398.75		\$ 2.83	\$ 155.65			\$ -
7	METAL TACK STRIP					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	10 BX			\$ 39.95	\$ 399.50		\$ 124.55	\$ 1,245.50			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	10 BX			\$ 41.95	\$ 419.50		\$ 136.15	\$ 1,361.50			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	10 BX			\$ 45.95	\$ 459.50		\$ 136.15	\$ 1,361.50			\$ -
8	NO DENT BUTTON BACKS					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	25 BX			\$ 16.95	\$ 423.75		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	25 BX			\$ 17.95	\$ 448.75		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	25 BX			\$ 18.95	\$ 473.75		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
9	NO SAG SPRINGS					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	5 EA			\$ 59.95	\$ 299.75		51.096	\$ 255.48			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	5 EA			\$ 64.95	\$ 324.75		55.848	\$ 279.24			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	5 EA			\$ 68.95	\$ 344.75		55.848	\$ 279.24			\$ -
10	#30 BUTTON CAPS					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	25 EA			\$ 15.75	\$ 393.75		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	25 EA			\$ 16.75	\$ 418.75		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	25 EA			\$ 17.75	\$ 443.75		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
11	#15 ROUND SPRING WASHERS					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	20 EA			\$ 10.95	\$ 219.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	20 EA			\$ 11.95	\$ 239.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	20 EA			\$ 12.95	\$ 259.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
12	PLAIN SPONGE DACRON (ANGEL HAIR)					\$ -			\$ -			\$ -
	1ST YEAR PRICING	100 LB			\$ 4.95	\$ 495.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	2ND YEAR PRICING	100 LB			\$ 5.25	\$ 525.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
	3RD YEAR PRICING	100 LB			\$ 5.50	\$ 550.00		NO BID	NO BID			\$ -
Total Page						\$ 53,754.50			\$ 23,608.76			\$ -
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A				(State / Preference)			OK / N/A			MI / N/A		
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)												
Bid Awarded to				Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:		
				Lead Time: 14 Days.			Lead Time: 3-4 Days.					
				Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes		
Split award. Lines 1, 2, 3, 5, 6, and 9 awarded to Burch Fabrics of Grand Rapids, MI. Lines 4, 7, 8, 10, 11 and 12 awarded to Oklahoma Upholstery Supply of Tulsa, OK.							Bid 100 per box on line 7. Multiplied bid price by 5 as request was for 500 per box on solicitation. Bid 50 feet coils on line 9. Figured price based on 120 feet coils as requested on solicitation.					