

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

| Requisition # 1310016123 | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---|---|----------|-----------------|--|-------------|--|-------------|--|-------------|-----------------------------|-------------|
| Solicitation # 1310003779 | | | | Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply Inc, Vero Beach, FL | | CPR Savers and First Aid Supply, Scottsdale, AZ | | Bob Barker Company, Fuquay Varina, NC | | GT Distributors, Austin, TX | |
| Closing Date 11/26/2013 | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Line Item No. | Description | Quantity | Unit of Measure | Unit Cost | Extension | Unit Cost | Extension | Unit Cost | Extension | Unit Cost | Extension |
| 1 | HELMET: Riot Helmet | 29 | ea | \$ 84.34 | \$ 2,445.86 | \$149.44 | \$ 4,333.76 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| | RIOT SHIELD: Law Enforcement protective shield | 2 | ea | | \$ - | \$172.45 | \$ 344.90 | \$129.68 | \$ 259.36 | \$117.98 | \$ 235.96 |
| 3 | HAND CUFFS: Hand Cuffs | 30 | pr | \$ 15.64 | \$ 469.20 | \$ 20.13 | \$ 603.90 | \$ 23.03 | \$ 690.90 | \$ 21.36 | \$ 640.80 |
| 4 | LEG IRONS: Law Enforcement Type. | 11 | ea | \$ 32.48 | \$ 357.28 | \$ 36.73 | \$ 404.03 | \$ 42.61 | \$ 468.71 | \$ 37.12 | \$ 408.32 |
| 5 | CHAINS: Belly Chains | 18 | ea | \$ 15.90 | \$ 286.20 | \$ 38.02 | \$ 684.36 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 56.48 | \$ 1,016.64 |
| 6 | HAND CUFFS: Hand Cuffs | 1100 | pr | \$ 1.89 | \$ 2,079.00 | \$ 0.37 | \$ 404.03 | \$ 2.36 | \$ 2,596.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 7 | HANDCUFF COVER: black | 14 | ea | \$ 17.30 | \$ 242.20 | \$ 15.94 | \$ 223.16 | \$ 20.07 | \$ 280.98 | \$ 17.72 | \$ 248.08 |
| 8 | MULTI-PURPOSE PLIERS: Multi-purpose tool with Belt Sheath | 7 | ea | \$ 32.71 | \$ 228.97 | \$ 34.09 | \$ 238.63 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 42.90 | \$ 300.30 |
| 9 | MAGAZINE POUCH: Duty Belt /Glock firearm | 272 | ea | \$ 16.79 | \$ 4,566.88 | \$ 21.95 | \$ 5,970.40 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 16.16 | \$ 4,395.52 |
| 10 | FLASHLIGHT: AC Charger, Police, Tactial | 45 | ea | \$ 23.16 | \$ 1,042.20 | \$ 17.71 | \$ 796.95 | \$ 95.07 | \$ 4,278.15 | \$ 27.31 | \$ 1,228.95 |
| 11 | HOLDER:flash light | 45 | ea | \$ 4.65 | \$ 209.25 | \$ 9.95 | \$ 447.75 | \$ 5.47 | \$ 246.15 | \$ 6.61 | \$ 297.45 |
| 12 | HOLSTER: Glock 17 Holster | 25 | ea | \$ 37.28 | \$ 932.00 | \$ 89.65 | \$ 2,241.25 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 49.97 | \$ 1,249.25 |
| 13 | BELT KEEPER: Dbl Snap | 20 | ea | \$ 7.25 | \$ 145.00 | \$ 11.20 | \$ 224.00 | \$ 4.67 | \$ 93.40 | \$ 8.79 | \$ 175.80 |
| 14 | HAND CUFFS: Hand Cuffs, Law Enforcement Type | 35 | pr | \$ 18.20 | \$ 637.00 | \$ 29.90 | \$ 1,046.50 | \$ 7.17 | \$ 250.95 | \$ 9.24 | \$ 323.40 |
| 15 | HOLDER: OC Spray Holder | 14 | ea | \$ 10.20 | \$ 142.80 | \$ 13.94 | \$ 195.16 | \$ 7.17 | \$ 100.38 | \$ 12.58 | \$ 176.12 |
| 16 | AMMUNITION MAGAZINE:Magazine to fit a Glock Pistol | 77 | ea | \$ 21.99 | \$ 1,693.23 | \$ 22.57 | \$ 1,737.89 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 21.12 | \$ 1,626.24 |
| 17 | BINOCULAR: | 1 | ea | \$ 81.79 | \$ 81.79 | \$ 66.71 | \$ 66.71 | \$ 99.46 | \$ 99.46 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 18 | LIGHT:Seal Beam | 9 | ea | \$ 34.77 | \$ 312.93 | \$ 20.56 | \$ 185.04 | \$475.47 | \$ 4,279.23 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 19 | .223 MAGAZINES-30 ROUNDS | 22 | ea | \$ 12.31 | \$ 270.82 | \$ 17.45 | \$ 383.90 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 13.21 | \$ 290.62 |
| 20 | BATON: PR-24 | 25 | ea | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 98.73 | \$ 2,468.25 | \$ 44.67 | \$ 1,116.75 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 20-2 | BATON: Expandable | 7 | ea | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 98.73 | \$ 691.11 | \$ 48.27 | \$ 337.89 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 21 | HYDRATION SYSTEM: | 39 | ea | \$ 52.12 | \$ 2,032.68 | \$ 55.99 | \$ 2,183.61 | \$ 23.88 | \$ 931.32 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 22 | READY BAG | 28 | ea | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 54.09 | \$ 1,514.52 | \$ 58.82 | \$ 1,646.96 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Total Page | | | | \$ 18,175.29 | | \$ 27,389.81 | | \$ 17,676.59 | | \$ 12,613.45 | |
| RECIPROCIITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) | | | | FL / Tied Bids | | AZ / Tied Bids and Small Business | | NC / Tied Bids | | TX / Tied Bids | |
| VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N) | | | | Y | | | | Y | | | |
| Bid Awarded to | | | | | | | | | | | |

| | | | | |
|---|---|--------------------|---------------------------|---------------------------|
| <p>Split award. Lines 1, 3, 4, 5, 8, 9, 11, 12, 13, 16 and 19 awarded to Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply of Vero Beach, FL. Lines, 6, 7, 10, 17, 18 and 22. awarded to CPR Savers and First Aid Supply of Scottsdale, AZ. Lines 2, 14, 15, 20 and 21 awarded to Bob Barker Company of Fuquay Varina, NC. Splitting lines results in a total cost of \$17,769.52 and a net savings of \$9,620.29 overall for the Agency.</p> | Lead Time: 30 Days | Lead Time: 60 Days | Lead Time: 30 Days ARO | Lead Time: 30 Days ARO |
| | Line 2 did not meet minimum specifications. | | | |

| Line | Lawmen's | CPR | Bob Barker | GT Distribtors |
|------|-----------------------------|-----------------------|------------------------|----------------------|
| 1 | Premier Crown #9005LT | | | |
| 2 | | Pauleson BS-1 | Paulsen BS-1 | Paulsen BS-1 |
| 3 | Peerless P010 | S&W 350103 | S&W #100 | Peerless 4710 |
| 4 | Peerless 703 | PR-4740 | S&W #1900 | Peerless 4740 |
| 5 | Peerless PSC78 | CSI CSIHC-7000 | | Peerless 4764 |
| 6 | Milspec Plastics #MS24D-250 | Safariland 8220-3-10B | Cobra Muff MS24D | |
| 7 | C&S Security Black Box #5 | CSIHC 7083 | Hiah Thompson #78010 | Thompson 7084 |
| 8 | Leatherman REBAR (831548) | Octane GB-30-000373 | | Gerber 07530 |
| 9 | Uncle Mike's #88361 | DeSanti's DLA48BAJJ20 | | Uncle Mike's #8836-1 |
| 10 | Mag-Lite #ST3D016 | Maglite S3D016 | Streamlight #75663 | Maglite ST3D016 |
| 11 | Uncle Mike's #88621 | 5545-3 | Tru Spec Atlanco #4629 | Uncle Mike's #8862-1 |
| 12 | Uncle Mike's #98211/98212 | 6280-8321-431-S | | Uncle Mike's #4321-1 |
| 13 | Uncle Mike's #88652 | GG K76-4WBS | Tru Spec Atlanco #4109 | Uncle Mike's #8865-2 |
| 14 | Uncle Mike's #88781 | ASP 56137 | Tru Spec Atlanco #9035 | Uncle Mike's #8835-1 |
| 15 | Uncle Mike's #88691 | Boston 5537-3 | Tru Spec Atlanco | Uncle Mike's #8869-1 |
| 16 | Glock #MGGL17017 | Promag SAIGA | | Glock MF17117 |
| 17 | Bushnell #120150 | Prosport PORRO | Bushnell #120150 | |
| 18 | Brinkmann Max Million II | Stanley IM | Streamlight #45601 | |
| 19 | Magpul #MAG557BLK | Promag SAIGA | | |
| 20 | | ASP F26 | ASP | |
| 21 | Camelbak Thermobak 2L | Cambelback 50ag Dart | Damascus HS40X | |
| 22 | | Acomp4250 | Damascus #PB-2 | |