

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition #	1310014988		Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			Vendor Name and Address			
Solicitation #	1310003649		Bob Barker Company, Fuqua Varina, NC			Shoe Corporation of Birmingham, Birmingham, AL			Goaltex Corp, Syosset, NY			ICS Jail Supplies Inc, Waco, TX			Shoe Corporation of Birmingham, Birmingham, AL			
Closing Date	3/6/2013																	
Buyer	Randy Pogue, CPO																	
Line Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension	Type	Unit Cost	Extension
1	Canvas Shoes	942	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 2,430.36		\$ 3.28	\$ 3,089.76		\$ 3.17	\$ 2,986.14		\$ 5.60	\$ 5,275.20			\$ -
2	Canvas Shoes	528	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 1,362.24		\$ 3.28	\$ 1,731.84		\$ 3.17	\$ 1,673.76		\$ 5.60	\$ 2,956.80			\$ -
3	Canvas Shoes	67	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 172.86		\$ 3.28	\$ 219.76		\$ 3.17	\$ 212.39		\$ 5.60	\$ 375.20			\$ -
4	Canvas Shoes	222	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 572.76		\$ 3.28	\$ 728.16		\$ 3.17	\$ 703.74		\$ 5.60	\$ 1,243.20			\$ -
5	Canvas Shoes	129	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 332.82		\$ 3.28	\$ 423.12		\$ 3.17	\$ 408.93		\$ 5.60	\$ 722.40			\$ -
6	Canvas Shoes	330	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 851.40		\$ 3.28	\$ 1,082.40		\$ 3.17	\$ 1,046.10		\$ 5.60	\$ 1,848.00			\$ -
7	Canvas Shoes	4392	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 11,331.36		\$ 3.28	\$ 14,405.76		\$ 3.17	\$ 13,922.64		\$ 5.60	\$ 24,595.20			\$ -
8	Canvas Shoes	60	EA		\$ 2.58	\$ 154.80		\$ 3.28	\$ 196.80		\$ 3.17	\$ 190.20		\$ 5.60	\$ 336.00			\$ -
9	Black Boots	35	EA		\$ 15.74	\$ 550.90		\$ 13.97	\$ 488.95	No Bid	No Bid		\$21.91	\$ 766.85			\$ -	
10	Black Boots	700	EA		\$ 15.74	\$ 11,018.00		\$ 13.97	\$ 9,779.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$21.91	\$ 15,337.00			\$ -	
11	Black Boots	30	EA		\$ 15.74	\$ 472.20		\$ 13.97	\$ 419.10	No Bid	No Bid		\$21.91	\$ 657.30			\$ -	
12	Black Boots	47	EA		\$ 15.74	\$ 739.78		\$ 13.97	\$ 656.59	No Bid	No Bid		\$21.91	\$ 1,029.77			\$ -	
13	Black Boots	30	EA		\$ 15.74	\$ 472.20		\$ 13.97	\$ 419.10	No Bid	No Bid		\$21.91	\$ 657.30			\$ -	
14	Black Boots	120	EA		\$ 15.74	\$ 1,888.80		\$ 13.97	\$ 1,676.40	No Bid	No Bid		\$21.91	\$ 2,629.20			\$ -	
Total Page					\$	32,350.48		\$	35,316.74		\$	21,143.90		\$	58,429.42			\$ -
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A	(State / Preference)		NC / Tied Bids			NY / Tied Bids			NY / Tied Bids									
VENDOR REGISTERED?	(Y / N)																	
Bid Awarded to			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			Supplier Remarks:			
			Lead Time: 7-30 Days ARO. Line 1, not available in size 4.5 (24 pairs). Line 14, not available in sizes 13.5, 14.5 and 15.5 (20 pairs).			Lead Time: 90 Days ARO			Lead Time: 90 Days ARO			Lead Time: 5-7 Days			Alternate bid for canvas shoes to be purchased by container.			
			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			Buyer Tab Notes			
Bob Barker Company															Bid specifications stated "Vendor shall bid quantities as specified. Not doing so shall result in bid being considered non-responsive." <u>NON-RESPONSIVE BID.</u>			